Amy Ow

From: Camille Leung

Sent: Monday, January 17, 2022 8:22 PM

To: Amy Ow

Subject: FW: SWCA Invoice Submittal for Project Highland Estates Environmental Compliance
Support Services

Attachments: Highland Estates Environmental Comp Invoice 000138915.pdf

From: Camille Leung

Sent: Monday, January 17, 2022 8:22 PM

To: PLANNING_Fiscal <PLANNING_Fiscal@smcgov.org>

Subject: FW: SWCA Invoice Submittal for Project Highland Estates Environmental Compliance Support Services

Ok to pay — thanks!

From: De'Jeann Johnson <DeJeann.Johnson@swca.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 13, 2022 8:54 AM

To: Camille Leung <cleung@smcgov.org>

Cc: Payment <Payment@swca.com>; Kristen Outten <koutten@swca.com>; Jennifer Torre <JTorre@swca.com>
Subject: SWCA Invoice Submittal for Project Highland Estates Environmental Compliance Support Services

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of San Mateo County. Unless you recognize the sender's email address and know
the content is safe, do not click links, open attachments or reply.

Good Morning,

Attached is SWCA's invoice #000138915 dated 01/13/2022 for 00046217-000-HMB - Highland Estates Environmental
Compliance Support Services. Please reference the invoice number on your remittance.

Our Preferred method of payment is ACH/Wire as indicated on the invoice. If you prefer, you may mail payment to our
lockbox at PO Box 7217, Carol Stream, IL 60197-7217.

Please let me know if anything more is needed to process this invoice.

Thank You,

De’Jeann Johnson
Senior Project Accounting Specialist

SWCA Environmental Consultants

20 E. Thomas Rd. Suite# 1700

Phoenix, AZ 85012

Main 602.274.3831 | Direct 480.581.5313

SWCA | Aovtiisas



